ANNUAL SUPPLY CONTRACT FOR
INSECTICIDES FOR MOSQUITO CONTROL
BID NUMBER 2022.02

AWARD
November 24, 2021

November 24, 2021, Calhoun County Commissioners Court awarded the bids for the Annual
Supply Contract for Insecticides for Mosquito Control for the period beginning January 1, 2022
and ending December 31, 2022.

January 12, 2022, Calhoun County Commissioners Court revised the award from November 24,
2021.

See Revised Award Bid Tabulation for Awarded Bids
Bid Period: January 1, 2022 thru December 31, 2022



REVISED AWARD BID TABULATION
For Insecticides for Mosquito Control for

January 1, 2022 thru December 31, 2022

Original Award Approved by Commissioners Court November 24, 2021
Revised Award Approved by Commissioners Court January 12, 2022
(Only 2 Bid Awards changed — See page 4 of Bid Tabulation)



REVISED AWARD - January 12, 2022

Original Award November 24, 2021 - See Page 4 for the 2 Revised Bid Awards
Calhoun County, Texas Awarded Bids are Highlighted in Yellow

BID TABULATION - ANNUAL SUPPLY CONTRACT FOR INSECTICIDES FOR MOSQUITO CONTROL, BID NUMBER: 2022.02 - ALL PRECINCTS
For Period Beginning JANUARY 1 2022 and Ending DECEMBER 31, 2022

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL RENTOKIL NORTH AMERICA, INC. ES OPCO USA LLC
ADAPCO LLC PRODUCTS INC dba TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS dba VESERIS
BID ITEM UNIT DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS MET SPECIFICATIONS DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS MET SPECIFICATIONS
Mineral Oil - . .
. .. . BVA 13 Mosquito ULV Diluent or
BVA Mosquito Larvicide Oil - Calpar 80 ULV Mineral Oil COCOBEAR BVA 13 Mosquito ULV Diluent MAXPAR G2-60
MC30 or Equivalent DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS Mosquito Larvicide Oil DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS Paraffinic base oil product
5 Gallon Pail $78.10 (BVA 13) $105.48 $82.97 NA
50 Gallon Drum $651.00 (BVA 13) NO BID $640.00 $360.00
55 Gallon Drum $610.50 (Calpar 80) $1,125.14 $690.00 $395.00
275 Gallon Tote $3,264.25 (Calpar 80) $5,492.00 $2,940.00 $2,100.00

_=—¥mhe_— e —————————
Fyfanon ULV

Active Ingredients: Malathion 96.5% Fyfanon ULV
MALATHION DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS Active Ingredients: Malathion 96.5%
2 x 2.5 Gallon Case $386.72 NO BID NO BID $350.00
5 Gallon Pail NO BID NO BID NO BID NA
55 Gallon Drum $4,050.59 NO BID NO BID NA
260 Gallon Tote $18,482.10 NO BID NO BID NA
ADDED BY BIDDER: Unit = BULK $57.00/Gallon
Minimum order 1000 gallons, price Gallon Minimum Order is 1,000 Gallons
is cheaper than other size options 1,000 Gallons Minimum $57.00 x 1,000 = $57,000.00
= ———— ————————————— —————— ————————————————————————————— |
Fyfanon EW
Active Ingredients: Malathion 40.9%
MALATHION EW DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS
Only 1 Bid Received - 2 x 2.5 Gallon Case $316.42 NO BID NO BID NA
THE BIDDER DID NOT MEET
SPECIFICATIONS 30 Gallon Drum $1,806.53 NO BID NO BID NA

]
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BID ITEM

UNIT

ADAPCO LLC
DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL
PRODUCTS INC
MET SPECIFICATIONS

RENTOKIL NORTH AMERICA, INC.
dba TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS
DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

ES OPCOUSALLC
dba VESERIS
MET SPECIFICATIONS

30-30 ULV

31-66 ULV

31-67 ULV

PermaSease 30-30
Active Ingredients: Permethrin 30.0%;
Piperonyl Butoxide 30.0%
DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

Biomist 30+30
Active Ingredients: Permethrin 30.0%;
Piperonyl Butoxide 30.0%

Permanone 30-30 & Perm-X 30-30
Active Ingredients: Permethrin 30.0%;
Piperonyl Butoxide 30.0%

DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

MasterLine Kontrol 30-30
Active Ingredients: Permethrin 30.0%;
Piperonyl Butoxide 30.0%

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case $344.75 $826.36 $325.00 (Perm-X 30-30) $301.02
5 Gallon Pail NO BID NO BID $305.00 (Permanone 30-30) NA
30 Gallon Drum $2,072.10 $4,880.64 $1,830.00 (Permanone 30-30) $1,695.00
55 Gallon Drum NO BID $8,875.68 $3,520.00 (Perm-X 30-30) $3,295.00
275 Gallon Tote $18,733.00 $35,228.60 $16,775.00 (Permanone 30-30) $16,200.00

BIOMIST 31+66
Active Ingredients: Permethrin 31.28%;
Piperonyl Butoxide 66%

Permanone 31-66 & Perm-X UL 31-66
Active Ingredients: Permethrin 31.28%;
Piperonyl Butoxide 66%

DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

Perm-X UL 31-66
Active Ingredients: Permethrin 31%;
Piperonyl Butoxide 66%

$388.00 (Permanone 31-66)

4 x 1 Gallon Case NO BID NO BID NA
2 x 2.5 Gallon Case NO BID $1,029.28 $485.00 (Perm-X UL 31-66) $550.00
30 Gallon Drum NO BID $4,456.56 $2,910.00 (Permanone 31-66) $3,276.60
275 Gallon Tote NO BID NO BID $26,675.00 (Permanone 31-66) $30,035.50

PermaSease 31-67
Active Ingredients: Permethrin 31.15%;
Piperonyl Butoxide 66.85%
DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

MasterLine Kontrol 31-67
Active Ingredients: Permethrin 31.15%;
Piperonyl Butoxide 66.85%

4 x 1 Gallon Case NO BID NO BID NO BID NA
2 x 2.5 Gallon Case $494.30 NO BID NO BID $500.00
30 Gallon Drum $3,600.00 NOBID NO BID $3,000.00
275 Gallon Tote $33,000.00 NO BID NO BID $28,000.00

Page 2 of 4



BID ITEM

UNIT

ADAPCO LLC
DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL
PRODUCTS INC
MET SPECIFICATIONS

RENTOKIL NORTH AMERICA, INC.
dba TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS
DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

ES OPCOUSALLC
dba VESERIS
MET SPECIFICATIONS

4-4 ULV

4-8 ULV

2 Bids Received - BOTH BIDDERS
DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

PermaSease 4-4
Active Ingredients: Permethrin 4.6%;
Piperonyl butoxide 4.6%
DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

Biomist 4+4
Active Ingredients: Premethrin 4%;
Piperonyl Butoxide 4%

Perm-X UL 4-4
Active Ingredients: Permethrin 4%;
Piperonyl Butoxide 4%
DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

MasterLine Kontrol 4-4
Active Ingredients: Permethrin 4.6%;
Piperonyl Butoxide 4.6%

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case $155.00 $110.00 5115.65 $87.00
30 Gallon Drum NO BID $660.00 5585.50 $515.00
55 Gallon Drum $1,054.35 $1,210.00 51,010.00 $1,010.00
275 Gallon Tote $4,983.00 $6,325.00 54,568.00 $4,600.00

Bidding Alternate:
PermaSease 3-15
Permethrin 3.0%; Piperonyl Butoxide
15.0%

DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

Permanone Ready To Use
Active Ingredients: Permethrin 3.98%;
Piperonyl Butoxide 8.48%

DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case $154.00 NO BID $200.00 NA
30 Gallon Tote $924.00 NO BID $1,110.00 NA

55 Gallon Drum NO BID NO BID N/A NA
275 Gallon Tote $8,470.00 NO BID $9,762.50 NA
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BID ITEM

UNIT

ADAPCO LLC
DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL
PRODUCTS INC
MET SPECIFICATIONS

RENTOKIL NORTH AMERICA, INC.
dba TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS
DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

ES OPCOUSALLC
dba VESERIS
MET SPECIFICATIONS

ALTOSID 30 DAY BRIQUETS

ALTOSID XR EXTENDED
RESIDUAL BRIQUETS - Altosid
XR Briquets

DELTAGARD or Equivalent

Only 1 Bid Received -
THE BIDDER DID NOT MEET
SPECIFICATIONS

FOURSTAR SUSTAINED
RELEASE 45 DAY MICROBIAL
BRIQUETS

FOURSTAR SUSTAINED RELEASE
90 DAY MICROBIAL BRIQUETS

FOURSTAR SUSTAINED RELEASE
180 DAY MICROBIAL BRIQUETS

Altosid 30 Day Briquets
Active Ingredients:
(S)-Methoprene 8.62%

Altosid 30 Day Briquets
Active Ingredients: (S)-Methoprene 8.62%
DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

Altosid 30 Day Briquets
Active Ingredients: (S)-Methoprene 8.62%

400 Per Case

NO BID

$480.00 - 2021 Price (wrong year's price)
Award RESCINDED January 12, 2022

Altosid XR Extended Residual Briquets
Active Ingredients:
(S)-Methoprene 2.1%

$500.00

Altosid XR Extended Residual Briquets
Active Ingredients:
(S)-Methoprene 2.1%

DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

$500.00
Awarded January 12, 2022

Altosid XR Extended Residual Briquets
Active Ingredients:
(S)-Methoprene 2.1%

220 Per Case

NO BID

$759.00 - 2021 Price (wrong year's price)
Award RESCINDED January 12, 2022

$787.60

DeltaGard (ground) - Imperium (aerial)
Active Ingredients: Deltamethrin 2.0%
DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

$787.60
Awarded January 12, 2022

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case NO BID NO BID $1,120.00 NA
30 Gallon Drum NO BID NO BID $6,510.00 NA
250 Gallon Drum(Tote) NO BID NO BID $53,750.00 NA

*Bidding 2 Alternates - not exact
substitute:
1. Vectomax WSP (800 WSP/case)
Bs 2.7%; Bti 4.5%;
2. Metalarv XRP: (S) Methoprene 4.25%
DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

Fourstar Sustained Release Microbial
45/90/180 Day Briquets
Active Ingredients: Bacillus sphaericus 2362,
Serotype H5a5b, Strain AML614

fermentation solids, spores and insecticidal

toxins 6%; Bacillus thuringiensis subspecies
israelensis Strain BMP 144 fermentation
solids, spores and insecticidal toxins 1%

* Alternate: Vectomax WSP|

800/Case $1,310.00
* Alternate: Metalarv XRP|
800/Case $1,760.00
* Alternate: Metalarv XRP|
200/Case $450.00
45 Day --- 200 Per Case NO BID $290.00 NO BID NA

90 Day --- 200 Per Case

180 Day --- 200 Per Case

NO BID

NO BID

$482.00

$752.00

NO BID

NO BID

NA

NA
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