
Calhoun County, Texas

BID ITEM UNIT ADAPCO LLC

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL 

PRODUCTS INC

RENTOKIL NORTH AMERICA, INC.                           

dba TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS

ES OPCO USA LLC                                          

dba VESERIS

  Mineral Oil  BVA 13 ULV Oil or Callpar 80N                                                                       BVA 13 Diluent Oil                                                                                           

MaxPar G2-60                                                     
MaxPar G2-60 equivalent to BVA 13 - see bid 

page 5 (2)                                         

5 Gallon Pail $40.95 No Bid
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and 

Affidavit was not notarized  $46.25 No Bid

50 Gallon Drum $409.50 No Bid
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  $372.00 $350.00 

55 Gallon Drum $450.45 No Bid
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  $409.00 $385.00

275 Gallon Tote $2,282.50 No Bid
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized   2,131.75 $1,925.00

  MALATHION    
Fyfanon ULV                                                         

Active Ingredients:  Malathion 96.5%                                                                                        

Fyfanon ULV                                                        

Active Ingredients:  Malathion 96.5%                                                                                       

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 Gallon Pail $325.25 No Bid No Bid $325.25 

55 Gallon Drum $3,464.45 No Bid No Bid $3,464.45

260 Gallon Tote $15,446.60 No Bid No Bid $15,446.60

  MALATHION EW
Fyfanon EW                                                       

Active Ingredients:  Malathion 40.9%

Malathion 5EC                                                             

Active Ingredients: Malathion 57%

Fyfanon EW                                                       

Active Ingredients:  Malathion 40.9%

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case $261.90 No Bid
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  225.00 $261.90

30 Gallon Drum $1,538.10 No Bid
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  1,350.00 $1,538.10

  30-30 ULV

PermaSease 30-30                                      

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 30.0%; 

Piperonyl Butoxide 30.0%                                                                               

Biomist 30+30                                                 

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 30.0%; 

Piperonyl butoxide 30.0%                                                                         

** Permanone 30-30   & Perm-X UL 30-30 **                                               

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 30.0%;              

Piperonyl Butoxide 30.0%                  

MasterLine Kontrol 30-30                                                 

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 30.0%;  

Piperonyl Butoxide 30.0%                                      

        ** Perm-X UL 30-30 ** 2 x 2.5 Gallon Case $299.85 $325.00 
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  305.00 $289.65

        ** Permanone 30-30 ** 5 Gallon Pail No Bid No Bid
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  295.00 No Bid

        ** Permanone 30-30 ** 30 Gallon Drum $1,799.10 $1,950.00 
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  1,770.00 $1,582.50

        ** Perm-X UL 30-30 ** 55 Gallon Drum No Bid $3,575.00 
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  3,300.00 $2,915.00

       ** Permanone 30-30 ** 275 Gallon Tote $16,491.75 $17,875.00 
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  16,225.00 $14,162.50

  31-66 ULV

**  Permanone 31-66 & Perm-X UL 31-66 **                                               

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 31.28%;                  

Piperonyl Butoxide 66%                                                        

Perm-X UL 31-66                                                 

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 31%; 

Piperonyl Butoxide 66%

        ** Permanone 31-66 ** 4 x 1 Gallon Case No Bid No Bid
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  376.00 No Bid

       ** Perm-X UL 31-66 ** 2 x 2.5 Gallon Case No Bid No Bid
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  470.00 $480.00

       ** Permanone 31-66 ** 30 Gallon Drum No Bid No Bid
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  2,820.00 $2,880.00

       ** Permanone 31-66 ** 275 Gallon Tote No Bid No Bid
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  25,850.00 $26,400.00
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AWARD                                                                                                                                                                              

Awarded Bids are Highlighted in Yellow

BID TABULATION - INSECTICIDES FOR MOSQUITO CONTROL ANNUAL SUPPLY CONTRACT, BID NUMBER: 2021.02  -  ALL PRECINCTS

For Period Beginning JANUARY 1 2021 and Ending DECEMBER 31, 2021

Per Local Government Code 262.027(b): 

Tie BIds - Award determined by drawing 

in Commissioners Court on 11/25/20                   

Per Local Government Code 262.027(b):           

Tie Bids - Award determined by drawing 

in Commissioners Court on 11/25/20                       



AWARD - Bid Tabulation  --  Insecticides for Mosquito Control Annual Supply Contract, Bid Number: 2021.02  --  Continued

BID ITEM UNIT ADAPCO LLC

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL 

PRODUCTS INC

RENTOKIL NORTH AMERICA, INC.                             

dba TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS

ES OPCO USA LLC                                          

dba VESERIS

  31-67 ULV

PermaSease 31-67                                          

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 31.15%;     

Piperonyl Butoxide 66.85%

MasterLIne Kontrol 31-67                                   

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 31.15%;         

Piperonyl Butoxide 66.85%

4 x 1 Gallon Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case $433.45 No Bid No Bid $430.00

30 Gallon Drum $2,609.40 No Bid No Bid $2,580.00

275 Gallon Tote $23,919.50 No Bid No Bid $23,650.00

  4-4 ULV

PermaSease 4-4                                                

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 4.6%;       

Piperonyl butoxide 4.6%

Biomist 4+4                                                   

Active Ingredients: Premethrin 4%;      

Piperonyl Butoxide 4%

Perm-X UL 4-4                                                             

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 4%;                         

Piperonyl Butoxide 4%

MasterLine Kontrol 4-4                                         

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 4.6%;             

Piperonyl Butoxide 4.6%

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case $87.45 $100.00
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  109.06 $82.50

30 Gallon Drum No Bid $600.00
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  552.35 $495.00

55 Gallon Drum $961.95 $1,100.00
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  1,009.40 $1,650.00

275 Gallon Tote $4,809.75 $5,500.00
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  4,671.88 $4,537.50

  4-8 ULV  --                                                
NO BIDS  due to Vendor not meeting 

specifications

Permanone RTU                                                            

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 3.98%;                     

Piperonyl Butoxide 8.48%

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case No Bid No Bid
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  185.70 No Bid

30 Gallon Tote No Bid No Bid
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  1,110.00 No Bid

55 Gallon Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

275 Gallon Tote No Bid No Bid
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  9,762.50 No Bid

  ALTOSID 30 DAY BRIQUETS                                             

Altosid 30 Day Briquets                                                                   

Active Ingredients:                                           

(S)-Methoprene 8.62%                          

Altosid 30 Day Briquets                                                                   

Active Ingredients: (S)-Methoprene 8.62%          

Altosid 30 Day Briquets                                                                   

Active Ingredients: (S)-Methoprene 8.62%            

400 Per Case No Bid $480.00 
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  480.00 $476.00 

  ALTOSID XR EXTENDED 

RESIDUAL BRIQUETS - Altosid 

XR Briquets                

Altosid XR Briquets                                                                   

Active Ingredients:                                            

(S)-Methoprene 2.1%

Altosid XR Briquets                                                                   

Active Ingredients:                                                                  

(S)-Methoprene 2.1%   

Altosid XR Briquets                                                                   

Active Ingredients:                                                     

(S)-Methoprene 2.1%            

220 Per Case No Bid $759.00 
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  759.00 $752.40 

  DELTAGARD or Equivalent
Deltagard ULV                                               

Active Ingredients: Deltamethrin 2.0%                                                   

DeltaGard                                                                                

Active Ingredients: Deltamethrin 2.0%                                                 

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case $981.00 No Bid
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  1,060.00 No Bid

30 Gallon Drum $5,740.80 No Bid
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  6,210.00 No Bid

250 Gallon Drum(Tote) $47,262.50 No Bid
Did not meet specifications: Did not sign Bid and Affidavit was 

not notarized  51,000.00 No Bid
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AWARD - Bid Tabulation  --  Insecticides for Mosquito Control Annual Supply Contract, Bid Number: 2021.02  --  Continued

BID ITEM UNIT ADAPCO LLC

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL 

PRODUCTS INC

RENTOKIL NORTH AMERICA, INC.                             

dba TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS

ES OPCO USA LLC                                          

dba VESERIS

  FOURSTAR SUSTAINED 

RELEASE 45 DAY MICROBIAL 

BRIQUETS

*Alternate not exact substitute:              

Vectomax WSP (800 WSP/case)                                                

Active Ingredients: Bacillus sphaericus 

2362, Serotype H5a5b, Strain ABTS 1743 

Technical Powder (670 BSITU/mg) 7.5%                                               

Fourstar 45/90/180 Day Briquets       

Microabial Briquets                             

Active Ingredients: Bacillus sphaericus 

2362, Serotype H5a5b, Strain AML614 

fermentation solids, spores and 

insecticidal toxins 6%; Bacillus 

thuringiensis subspecies israelensis 

Strain BMP 144 fermentation solids, 

spores and insecticidal toxins 1%

Summit B.t.i. Briquets                                      

Equivalent to Fourstar 45 Day Briquets          

see bid page 5 (1)                                                  

Active Ingredients: Bacillius thuringiensis 

subspecies israelensis solids, spores and 

insecticidal toxins 10.31%

Per Vendor:  Summit B.t.i. Equivalent to 

Fourstar 45 Day Briquets 30 Day --- 100 Per Case $82.50

* Alternate: Vectomax WSP -                                 

800 WSP/Case                                                       = 

$1,299.00 ÷ 4 = $324.75 per 200

*ALTERNATE:  800 WSP/Case  

45 Day --- 800 Per Case $1,299.00 

45 Day --- 200 Per Case $282.67 No Bid No Bid$

  FOURSTAR SUSTAINED RELEASE 

90 DAY MICROBIAL BRIQUETS 90 Day --- 200 Per Case No Bid $469.33 No Bid No Bid

  FOURSTAR SUSTAINED RELEASE 

180 DAY MICROBIAL BRIQUETS 180 Day --- 200 Per Case No Bid $733.33 No Bid No Bid
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