
CALHOUN COUNTY, TEXAS

LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL
MINIMUM 

LOAD/ORDER                   
AWARD

BIDDER                                                              
AND REMARKS, IF ANY

Precinct 1 Ton $6.00 $21.50 $27.50 24 tons                                     X

Precinct 2 Ton $6.00 $21.50 $27.50 24 tons                                     X

Precinct 3 Ton $6.00 $21.50 $27.50 24 tons                                     X

Precinct 4-P Ton $6.00 $21.50 $27.50 24 tons                                     X

Precinct 4-S Ton $6.00 $21.50 $27.50 24 tons                                     X

Precinct 1 Ton $5.50 $24.00 $29.50 Belly 25 tons

Precinct 2 Ton $5.50 $24.00 $29.50 Belly 25 tons

Precinct 3 Ton $5.50 $24.00 $29.50 Belly 25 tons

Precinct 4-P Ton $5.50 $24.50 $30.00 Belly 25 tons

Precinct 4-S Ton $5.50 $24.00 $29.50 Belly 25 tons

Precinct 1 Ton $6.00 $24.00 $30.00 24

Precinct 2 Ton $6.00 $24.00 $30.00 24

Precinct 3 Ton $6.00 $24.00 $30.00 24

Precinct 4-P Ton $6.00 $26.00 $32.00 24

Precinct 4-S Ton $6.00

$6.00                
(Bid has $6.00)

$30.00            
(Bid has $30) 24

Precinct 1 Ton $4.97 $26.48 $31.45 N/A

Precinct 2 Ton $4.97 $26.48 $31.45 N/A

Precinct 3 Ton $4.97 $26.48 $31.45 N/A

Precinct 4-P Ton $4.97 $26.48 $31.45 N/A

Precinct 4-S Ton $4.97 $26.48 $31.45 N/A
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BID TABULATION  --  AWARD

Quality Hot Mix, Inc.                                                    
*NOTE*  ALL DELIVERIES ARE IN END 

DUMP TRAILERS.  BELLY DUMP TRAILERS 

CAN BE REQUESTED & PROVIDED IF 

AVAILABLE.

BASELINE PRICE (November 9, 2020) FOR FUEL ADJUSTMENT ON DELIVERY PRICE:  $2.132 

Bid Item #1:  Limestone-3/4 Inch to Dust

AWARDED Bids are Highlighted in Yellow

Tie Bids:  The winning bid is determined per Texas Local Government Code 262.027(b).                                                            

Award determined by drawing in Commissioners Court on 11/25/20.

For the Period Beginning January 1, 2021 and Ending December 31, 2021

ROAD MATERIALS AND ASPHALTS, OILS AND EMULSIONS

K-C Lease Service, Inc.                           

dba                                                     

Matagorda Construction                        

& Materials 

MidTex Materials, LLC                                             
(Bid has error on Precinct 4-S)

Johnnie R. Gresham                       

Operating, Inc.

ANNUAL SUPPLY CONTRACT, BID NUMBER: 2021.03

ROAD MATERIALS 



LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL
MINIMUM 

LOAD/ORDER                   
AWARD

BIDDER                                                              
AND REMARKS, IF ANY

Precinct 1 Ton $6.00 $21.50 $27.50 24 tons X

Precinct 2 Ton $6.00 $21.50 $27.50 24 tons X

Precinct 3 Ton $6.00 $21.50 $27.50 24 tons X

Precinct 4-P Ton $6.00 $21.50 $27.50 24 tons X

Precinct 4-S Ton $6.00 $21.50 $27.50 24 tons X

Precinct 1 Ton $5.00 $24.00 $29.00 Belly 25 tons

Precinct 2 Ton $5.00 $24.00 $29.00 Belly 25 tons

Precinct 3 Ton $5.00 $24.00 $29.00 Belly 25 tons

Precinct 4-P Ton $5.00 $24.50 $29.50 Belly 25 tons

Precinct 4-S Ton $5.00 $24.00 $29.00 Belly 25 tons

Precinct 1 Ton $6.00 $24.00 $30.00 24

Precinct 2 Ton $6.00 $24.00 $30.00 24

Precinct 3 Ton $6.00 $24.00 $30.00 24

Precinct 4-P Ton $6.00 $26.00 $32.00 24

Precinct 4-S Ton $6.00 $24.00 $30.00 24

Precinct 1 Ton $4.47 $26.48 $30.95 N/A

Precinct 2 Ton $4.47 $26.48 $30.95 N/A

Precinct 3 Ton $4.47 $26.48 $30.95 N/A

Precinct 4-P Ton $4.47 $26.48 $30.95 N/A

Precinct 4-S Ton $4.47 $26.48 $30.95 N/A

Precinct 1 Ton $23.50 $14.00 $37.50 24 tons

Precinct 2 Ton $23.50 $14.25 $37.75 24 tons

Precinct 3 Ton $23.50 $15.96 $39.46 24 tons

Precinct 4-P Ton $23.50 $15.96 $39.46 24 tons

Precinct 4-S Ton $23.50 $13.80 $37.30 24 tons

Precinct 1 Ton $22.50 $19.00 $41.50 22 tons

Precinct 2 Ton $22.50 $20.00 $42.50 22 tons

Precinct 3 Ton $22.50 $21.50 $44.00 22 tons

Precinct 4-P Ton $22.50 $21.50 $44.00 22 tons

Precinct 4-S Ton $22.50 $19.00 $41.50 22 tons
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Quality Hot Mix, Inc.                                   
*NOTE*  ALL DELIVERIES ARE IN END 

DUMP TRAILERS.  BELLY DUMP TRAILERS 

CAN BE REQUESTED & PROVIDED IF 

AVAILABLE.

K-C Lease Service, Inc.                            

dba                                                                  

Matagorda Construction                         

& Materials

MidTex Materials, LLC

Johnnie R. Gresham                          

Operating, Inc.

Martin Marietta                                

Materials, Inc.                                                          
*VIA GREGORY RAIL YARD*                                        

*Page 8 of Bid, under Exceptions and/or      

Variations from Specifications and/or 

additional notes:  SEE ATTACHED LETTER 

REGARDING MATERIAL TESTING - NO 

LETTER WAS ATTACHED/INCLUDED WITH 

THEIR BID

Vulcan Materials Company            

dba                                                       

Vulcan Construction                     

Materials, LLC

Bid Item #2:  ITEM 247, TYPE A LIMESTONE, GRADE 2 [1 3/4 INCH]



LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL
MINIMUM 

LOAD/ORDER                   
AWARD

BIDDER                                                              
AND REMARKS, IF ANY

Precinct 1 Ton $6.00 $21.50 $27.50 24 tons X

Precinct 2 Ton $6.00 $21.50 $27.50 24 tons X

Precinct 3 Ton $6.00 $21.50 $27.50 24 tons X

Precinct 4-P Ton $6.00 $21.50 $27.50 24 tons X

Precinct 4-S Ton $6.00 $21.50 $27.50 24 tons X

Precinct 1 Ton $6.00 $24.00 $30.00 24

Precinct 2 Ton $6.00 $24.00 $30.00 24

Precinct 3 Ton $6.00 $24.00 $30.00 24

Precinct 4-P Ton $6.00 $26.00 $32.00 24

Precinct 4-S Ton $6.00 $24.00 $30.00 24

Precinct 1 Ton $4.47 $26.48 $30.95 N/A

Precinct 2 Ton $4.47 $26.48 $30.95 N/A

Precinct 3 Ton $4.47 $26.48 $30.95 N/A

Precinct 4-P Ton $4.47 $26.48 $30.95 N/A

Precinct 4-S Ton $4.47 $26.48 $30.95 N/A

Precinct 1 Ton $22.50 $19.00 $41.50 22 tons

Precinct 2 Ton $22.50 $20.00 $42.50 22 tons

Precinct 3 Ton $22.50 $21.50 $44.00 22 tons

Precinct 4-P Ton $22.50 $21.50 $44.00 22 tons

Precinct 4-S Ton $22.50 $19.00 $41.50 22 tons

LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL
MINIMUM 

LOAD/ORDER                   
BIDDER                                                              

AND REMARKS, IF ANY

Precinct              

1, 2, 3,                    

4-P & 4-S

Ton

____ of 47 Lb         

Bags on Pallet
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Vulcan Materials Company                   

dba                                                          

Vulcan Constructions                   

Materials, LLC

NO BIDS RECEIVED

Quality Hot Mix, Inc.                                              
*NOTE*  ALL DELIVERIES ARE IN END 

DUMP TRAILERS.  BELLY DUMP TRAILERS 

CAN BE REQUESTED & PROVIDED IF 

AVAILABLE.                         

MidTex Materials, LLC

Johnnie R. Gresham                             

Operating, Inc.

Bid Item #3:  ITEM 247, TYPE A LIMESTONE, GRADE 3 [1 3/4 INCH]

                              275.2-1, Hydraulic Cement Type 1, 47 lb Bag (Cost per Pallet) List # of 47 lb Bags on a Pallet

Bid Item #4:  ITEM 275, CEMENT                                                                                                                                                                
                              275-2.1, Hydraulic Cement Type 1, Bulk (Pneumatic Tankers, Spreader Bar Needed)



LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL
MINIMUM 

LOAD/ORDER                   
AWARD

BIDDER                                                              
AND REMARKS, IF ANY

Precinct 1 Ton $23.39 $38.61 $62.00 24 tons X

Precinct 2 Ton $23.70 $38.30 $62.00 24 tons X

Precinct 3 Ton $21.18 $40.82 $62.00 24 tons X

Precinct 4-P Ton $20.71 $41.29 $62.00 24 tons X

Precinct 4-S Ton $23.07 $38.93 $62.00 24 tons X

Precinct 1 Ton $53.00 $9.00 $62.00 24 tons

Precinct 2 Ton $53.00 $9.00 $62.00 24 tons

Precinct 3 Ton $53.00 $9.00 $62.00 24 tons

Precinct 4-P Ton $53.00 $9.00 $62.00 24 tons

Precinct 4-S Ton $53.00 $9.00 $62.00 24 tons

LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL
MINIMUM 

LOAD/ORDER                   
AWARD

BIDDER                                                              
AND REMARKS, IF ANY

Precinct 1 Ton $53.00 $9.00 $62.00 24 tons X

Precinct 2 Ton $53.00 $9.00 $62.00 24 tons X

Precinct 3 Ton $53.00 $9.00 $62.00 24 tons X

Precinct 4-P Ton $53.00 $9.00 $62.00 24 tons X

Precinct 4-S Ton $53.00 $9.00 $62.00 24 tons X

Precinct 1 Ton $23.39 $38.61 $62.00 24 tons

Precinct 2 Ton $23.70 $38.30 $62.00 24 tons

Precinct 3 Ton $21.18 $40.82 $62.00 24 tons

Precinct 4-P Ton $20.71 $41.29 $62.00 24 tons

Precinct 4-S Ton $23.07 $38.93 $62.00 24 tons
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Bid Item #6:  Item 302, Type PB, Grade 4 (Pre-Coated Rock)

Quality Hot Mix, Inc.                                           
*NOTE*  ALL DELIVERIES ARE IN END DUMP 

TRAILERS.  BELLY DUMP TRAILERS CAN BE 

REQUESTED & PROVIDED IF AVAILABLE.

Martin Marietta                                            

Materials, Inc.                                                        
*VIA BLACK SPUR QUARRY*                                                  

* Page 8 of Bid, under Exceptions and/or      

Variations from Specifications and/or 

additional notes:  SEE ATTACHED LETTER 

REGARDING MATERIAL TESTING - NO 

LETTER WAS ATTACHED/INCLUDED WITH 

THEIR BID

Martin Marietta                                    

Materials, Inc.                                                      
*VIA BLACK SPUR QUARRY*                                                     

* Page 8 of Bid, under Exceptions and/or      

Variations from Specifications and/or 

additional notes:  SEE ATTACHED LETTER 

REGARDING MATERIAL TESTING - NO 

LETTER WAS ATTACHED/INCLUDED WITH 

THEIR BID

Quality Hot Mix, Inc.                                           
*NOTE*  ALL DELIVERIES ARE IN END 

DUMP TRAILERS.  BELLY DUMP TRAILERS 

CAN BE REQUESTED & PROVIDED IF 

AVAILABLE.

Bid Item #5:  Item 302, Type PB, Grade 3 (Pre-Coated Rock)

NOTE:  Award for Bid Item #5 and Bid Item #6 was determined by drawing in Commissioners Court 

on 11/25/20  --  per Local Government Code 262.027(b)



LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL
MINIMUM 

LOAD/ORDER                   
AWARD

BIDDER                                                              
AND REMARKS, IF ANY

Precinct 1 Ton $22.50 $37.98 $60.48 24 tons X

Precinct 2 Ton $22.50 $38.75 $61.25 24 tons X

Precinct 3 Ton $22.50 $40.30 $62.80 24 tons X

Precinct 4-P Ton $22.50 $38.75 $61.25 24 tons X

Precinct 4-S Ton $22.50 $38.75 $61.25 24 tons X

Precinct 1 Ton $27.91 $38.61 $66.52 24 tons

Precinct 2 Ton $29.18 $38.30 $67.48 24 tons

Precinct 3 Ton $28.40 $40.82 $69.22 24 tons

Precinct 4-P Ton $27.93 $41.29 $69.22 24 tons

Precinct 4-S Ton $27.59 $38.93 $66.52 24 tons

LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL
MINIMUM 

LOAD/ORDER                   
AWARD

BIDDER                                                              
AND REMARKS, IF ANY

Precinct 1 Ton $23.50 $37.98 $61.48 24 tons X

Precinct 2 Ton $23.50 $38.75 $62.25 24 tons X

Precinct 3 Ton $23.50 $40.30 $63.80 24 tons X

Precinct 4-P Ton $23.50 $38.75 $62.25 24 tons X

Precinct 4-S Ton $23.50 $38.75 $62.25 24 tons X

Precinct 1 Ton $27.91 $38.61 $66.52 24 tons

Precinct 2 Ton $29.18 $38.30 $67.48 24 tons

Precinct 3 Ton $28.40 $40.82 $69.22 24 tons

Precinct 4-P Ton $27.93 $41.29 $69.22 24 tons

Precinct 4-S Ton $27.59 $38.93 $66.52 24 tons
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Bid Item #7:  Item 302, Type PE, Grade 3 (Pre-Coated Rock) *Material Source out of ______________*

Bid Item #8:  Item 302, Type PE, Grade 4 (Pre-Coated Rock) *Material Source out of ______________*

Martin Marietta                                     

Materials, Inc.                                                   

* MATERIAL SOURCE OUT OF UVALDE *                                                 

*VIA BLACK SPUR QUARRY*                                             

*Page 8 of Bid, under Exceptions and/or      

Variations from Specifications and/or 

additional notes:  SEE ATTACHED LETTER 

REGARDING MATERIAL TESTING - NO 

LETTER WAS ATTACHED/INCLUDED WITH 

THEIR BID

Vulcan Materials Company                             

dba                                                           

Vulcan Construction                     

Materials, LLC                                          
* MATERIAL SOURCE OUT OF                                              

DABNEY (UVALDE) *

Martin Marietta                                     

Materials, Inc.                                                              

* MATERIAL SOURCE OUT OF UVALDE *                                                                                                    

*Page 8 of Bid, under Exceptions and/or      

Variations from Specifications and/or 

additonal notes:  SEE ATTACHED LETTER 

REGARDING MATERIAL TESTING - NO 

LETTER WAS ATTACHED/INCLUDED WITH 

THEIR BID

Vulcan Materials Company                      

dba                                                         

Vulcan Construction                          

Materials, LLC                                                   
*MATERIAL SOURCE OUT OF                                        

DABNEY (UVALDE)*



LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL
MINIMUM 

LOAD/ORDER                   
AWARD

BIDDER                                                              
AND REMARKS, IF ANY

Precinct 1 Ton $15.50 $24.00 $39.50 Belly 25 tons X

Precinct 2 Ton $15.50 $24.00 $39.50 Belly 25 tons X

Precinct 3 Ton $15.50 $24.00 $39.50 Belly 25 tons X

Precinct 4-P Ton $15.50 $24.50 $40.00 Belly 25 tons X

Precinct 4-S Ton $15.50 $24.00 $39.50 Belly 25 tons X

Precinct 1 Ton $26.50 $23.50 $50.00 24 tons

Precinct 2 Ton $26.50 $23.50 $50.00 24 tons

Precinct 3 Ton $26.50 $23.50 $50.00 24 tons

Precinct 4-P Ton $26.50 $23.50 $50.00 24 tons

Precinct 4-S Ton $26.50 $23.50 $50.00 24 tons

LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL
MINIMUM 

LOAD/ORDER                   
AWARD

BIDDER                                                              
AND REMARKS, IF ANY

Precinct 1 Ton $10.50 $26.48 $36.98 N/A X

Precinct 2 Ton $10.50 $26.48 $36.98 N/A X

Precinct 3 Ton $10.50 $26.48 $36.98 N/A X

Precinct 4-P Ton $10.50 $26.48 $36.98 N/A X

Precinct 4-S Ton $10.50 $26.48 $36.98 N/A X

Precinct 1 Ton $40.50 $37.98 $78.48 24 tons

Precinct 2 Ton $40.50 $38.75 $79.25 24 tons

Precinct 3 Ton $40.50 $40.30 $80.80 24 tons

Precinct 4-P Ton $40.50 $38.75 $79.25 24 tons

Precinct 4-S Ton $40.50 $38.75 $79.25 24 tons

Precinct 1 Ton $46.00 $38.61 $84.61 24 tons

Precinct 2 Ton $46.00 $38.30 $84.30 24 tons

Precinct 3 Ton $46.00 $40.82 $86.82 24 tons

Precinct 4-P Ton $46.00 $41.29 $87.29 24 tons

Precinct 4-S Ton $46.00 $38.93 $84.93 24 tons
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Bid Item #10:  ITEM 330, TYPE D (PRE-MIX LIMESTONE)

Quality Hot Mix, Inc.                                             
*NOTE*  ALL DELIVERIES ARE IN END DUMP 

TRAILERS.  BELLY DUMP TRAILERES CAN BE 

REQUESTED & PROVIDED IF AVAILABLE.

Bid Item #9:  Item 302, Type E, Grade 5, Ice Rock (Non-Coated Limestone Only)

Johnnie R. Gresham                                 

Operating, Inc.

K-C Lease Service, Inc.                             

dba                                                       

Matagorda Construction                   

and Materials

Vulcan Materials Company             

dba                                                        

Vulcan Construction                             

Materials, LLC                                                       
* LIMESTONE ROCK ASPHALT *

Martin Marietta                                       

Materials, Inc.                                                 
*VIA BLACK SPUR QUARRY                                             

*Page 8 of Bid, under Exceptions and/or      

Variations from Specifications and/or 

additional notes:  SEE ATTACHED LETTER 

REGARDING MATERIAL TESTING - NO 

LETTER WAS ATTACHED/INCLUDED WITH 

THEIR BID



LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL
MINIMUM 

LOAD/ORDER                   
AWARD

BIDDER                                                              
AND REMARKS, IF ANY

Precinct 1 Ton $46.50 $37.98 $84.48 24 tons X

Yard³ No Bid

50 lb Bag No Bid

Precinct 2 Ton $46.50 $38.75 $85.25 24 tons X

Yard³ No Bid

50 lb Bag No Bid

Precinct 3 Ton $46.50 $40.30 $86.80 24 tons X

Yard³ No Bid

50 lb Bag No Bid

Precinct 4-P Ton $46.50 $38.75 $85.25 24 tons X

Yard³ No Bid

50 lb Bag No Bid

Precinct 4-S Ton $46.50 $38.75 $85.25 24 tons X

Yard³ No Bid

50 lb Bag No Bid

Ton $58.77 $39.18 $97.95 24 Tons

Precinct 1 Yard³ $65.23 $43.49 $108.72 22 Cu Yds X

50 lb Bag $12.00 ─ $12.00
62 Bags =                                

1 Pallet X

Ton $57.32 $38.22 $95.54 24 Tons

Precinct 2 Yard³ $67.64 $45.10 $112.74 22 Cu Yds X

50 lb Bag $12.00 ─ $12.00
62 Bags =                                

1 Pallet X

Ton $64.75 $43.17 $107.92 24 Tons

Precinct 3 Yard³ $76.41 $50.94 $127.35 22 Cu Yds X

50 lb Bag $12.00 ─ $12.00
62 Bags =                                

1 Pallet X

Ton $64.24 $42.82 $107.06 24 Tons

Precinct 4-P Yard³ $75.80 $50.53 $126.33 22 Cu Yds X

50 lb Bag $12.00 ─ $12.00
62 Bags =                                

1 Pallet X

Ton $62.28 $41.52 $103.80 24 Tons

Precinct 4-S Yard³ $73.49 $48.99 $122.48 22 Cu Yds X

50 lb Bag $12.00 ─ $12.00
62 Bags =                                

1 Pallet
X
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Vulcan Materials Company                      

dba                                                         

Vulcan Construction                                      

Materials, LLC                                                                    
* D PLUS MIX *

Bid Item #11:  ITEM 330 D, POTHOLE REPAIR, LIMESTONE ROCK ASPHALT (LRA)

Blades Group, LLC



LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL
MINIMUM 

LOAD/ORDER                   
AWARD

BIDDER                                                              
AND REMARKS, IF ANY

Precinct 1 Ton $75.00 $9.00 $84.00 25 tons X

Precinct 2 Ton $75.00 $9.00 $84.00 25 tons X

Precinct 3 Ton $75.00 $9.00 $84.00 25 tons X

Precinct 4-P Ton $75.00 $9.00 $84.00 25 tons X

Precinct 4-S Ton $75.00 $9.00 $84.00 25 tons X

Precinct 1 Ton $85.00 $30.59 $115.59

25 TONS 

DELIVERED

Precinct 2 Ton $85.00 $31.51 $116.51 25 TONS 

Precinct 3 Ton $85.00 $27.83 $112.83 25 TONS 

Precinct 4-P Ton $85.00 $35.19 $120.19 25 TONS 

Precinct 4-S Ton $85.00 $34.96 $119.96 25 TONS 

LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL
MINIMUM 

LOAD/ORDER                   
AWARD

BIDDER                                                              
AND REMARKS, IF ANY

Precinct 1 Ton $17.33 $34.13 $51.46 N/A X

Precinct 1 Ton $17.33 $34.13 $51.46 N/A X

Precinct 3 Ton $17.33 $34.13 $51.46 N/A X

Precinct 4-P Ton $17.33 $34.13 $51.46 N/A X

Precinct 4-S Ton $17.33 $34.13 $51.46 N/A X

Precinct 1 Ton $26.00 $50.00 $76.00 24

Precinct 2 Ton $26.00 $50.00 $76.00 24

Precinct 3 Ton $26.00 $50.00 $76.00 24

Precinct 4-P Ton $26.00 $52.00 $78.00 24

Precinct 4-S Ton $26.00 $50.00 $76.00 24

Precinct 1 Ton $40.00 $45.00 $85.00 22 tons

Precinct 2 Ton $40.00 $45.00 $85.00 22 tons

Precinct 3 Ton $40.00 $50.00 $90.00 22 tons

Precinct 4-P Ton $40.00 $47.00 $87.00 22 tons

Precinct 4-S Ton $40.00 $45.00 $85.00 22 tons
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Bid Item #12:  ITEM 334, TYPE D, HOT MIX COLD LAID ASPHALT CONCRETE PAVEMENT

Quality Hot Mix, Inc.                                  
*NOTE* ALL DELIVERIES ARE IN END DUMP 

TRAILERS.  BELLY DUMP TRAILERS CAN BE 

REQUESTED & PROVIDED IF AVAILABLE.                                                                                    

Waller County Asphalt, Inc.                       
* BID IS FOR HIGH PERFORMANCE                         

ASPPM GRADE IV *

Bid Item #13:  ITEM 432, Riprap, Section 2.3 Stone Riprap, 12" Limestone

Johnnie R. Gresham                        

Operating, Inc.

MidTex Materials, LLC

Vulcan Materials Company                               

dba                                                        

Vulcan Construction                     

Materials, LLC



LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL DEMURRAGE                               AWARD
BIDDER                                                              

AND REMARKS, IF ANY

Precinct 1 Gallon $2.00 $0.20 $2.20

$80.00 Per Hour                           

After 2 Free Hours X

Precinct 2 Gallon $2.00 $0.20 $2.20

$80.00 Per Hour                           

After 2 Free Hours X

Precinct 3 Gallon $2.00 $0.20 $2.20

$80.00 Per Hour                           

After 2 Free Hours X

Precinct 4-P Gallon $2.00 $0.20 $2.20

$80.00 Per Hour                           

After 2 Free Hours X

Precinct 4-S Gallon $2.00 $0.20 $2.20

$80.00 Per Hour                           

After 2 Free Hours X

Precinct 1 Gallon $2.65 $0.19 $2.84

$70.00 Per Hour                  

After 2 Free Hours       

Precinct 2 Gallon $2.65 $0.19 $2.84

$70.00 Per Hour                       

After 2 Free Hours       

Precinct 3 Gallon $2.65 $0.17 $2.82

$70.00 Per Hour                    

After 2 Free Hours       

Precinct 4-P Gallon $2.65 $0.21 $2.86

$70.00 Per Hour                     

After 2 Free Hours       

Precinct 4-S Gallon $2.65 $0.21 $2.86

$70.00 Per Hour                           

After 2 Free Hours       
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ASPHALTS, OILS AND EMULSIONS

Item 300, Asphalts, Oils and Emulsions

Bid Item #14:  Primer Oil

Cleveland Asphalt                                  

Products, Inc.                                            
* PRICE BASED ON MINIMUM FULL LOAD 

OF 5000 GALLONS, FOR SMALLER 

QUANTITIES PLEASE CALL 800-334-0177.                                                             

DILUTED MATERIAL CANNOT BE 

RETURNED FOR CREDIT.

Martin Products Sales, LLC              

dba                                                        

Martin Asphalt Company                                                                        
* MC-30 *                                                                               

* 5,000 GAL MINIMUM                                                



LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL DEMURRAGE                               AWARD
BIDDER                                                              

AND REMARKS, IF ANY

Precinct 1 Gallon $2.55 $0.19 2.74

$70.00 Per Hour                      

After 2 Free Hours       X

Precinct 2 Gallon $2.55 $0.19 2.74

$70.00 Per Hour                    

After 2 Free Hours       X

Precinct 3 Gallon $2.55 $0.17 2.72

$70.00 Per Hour                    

After 2 Free Hours       X

Precinct 4-P Gallon $2.55 $0.21 2.76

$70.00 Per Hour                    

After 2 Free Hours       X

Precinct 4-S Gallon $2.55 $0.21 2.76

$70.00 Per Hour                        

After 2 Free Hours       X

Precinct 1 Gallon $2.75 $0.20 2.95

$80.00 Per Hour                           

After 2 Free Hours

Precinct 2 Gallon $2.75 $0.20 2.95

$80.00 Per Hour                           

After 2 Free Hours

Precinct 3 Gallon $2.75 $0.20 2.95

$80.00 Per Hour                           

After 2 Free Hours

Precinct 4-P Gallon $2.75 $0.20 2.95

$80.00 Per Hour                           

After 2 Free Hours

Precinct 4-S Gallon $2.75 $0.20 2.95

$80.00 Per Hour                           

After 2 Free Hours

LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL DEMURRAGE                               AWARD
BIDDER                                                              

AND REMARKS, IF ANY

Precinct 1 Gallon $1.75 $0.20 $1.95

$80.00 Per Hour                           

After 2 Free Hours X

Precinct 2 Gallon $1.75 $0.20 $1.95

$80.00 Per Hour                           

After 2 Free Hours X

Precinct 3 Gallon $1.75 $0.20 $1.95

$80.00 Per Hour                           

After 2 Free Hours X

Precinct 4-P Gallon $1.75 $0.20 $1.95

$80.00 Per Hour                           

After 2 Free Hours X

Precinct 4-S Gallon $1.75 $0.20 $1.95

$80.00 Per Hour                           

After 2 Free Hours X

Precinct 1 Gallon $1.85 $0.19 $2.04

$70.00 Per Hour                  

After 2 Free Hours       

Precinct 2 Gallon $1.85 $0.19 $2.04

$70.00 Per Hour                       

After 2 Free Hours       

Precinct 3 Gallon $1.85 $0.17 $2.02

$70.00 Per Hour                    

After 2 Free Hours       

Precinct 4-P Gallon $1.85 $0.21 $2.06

$70.00 Per Hour                     

After 2 Free Hours       

Precinct 4-S Gallon $1.85 $0.21 $2.06

$70.00 Per Hour                           

After 2 Free Hours       
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Bid Item #16:  CRS-2

Bid Item #15:  RC-250

Cleveland Asphalt                    

Products, Inc.                                         
* PRICE BASED ON MINIMUM FULL LOAD 

OF 5000 GALLONS, FOR SMALLER 

QUANTITIES PLEASE CALL 800-334-0177.                                                             

DILUTED MATERIAL CANNOT BE 

RETURNED FOR CREDIT.

Martin Products Sales, LLC                

dba                                                       

Martin Asphalt Company                                                   
* 5000 GALLON MINIMUM

Martin Products Sales, LLC                  

dba                                                        

Martin Asphalt Company                                            
* 5000 GALLON MINIMUM

Cleveland Asphalt                       

Products, Inc.                                           
* PRICE BASED ON MINIMUM FULL LOAD 

OF 5000 GALLONS, FOR SMALLER 

QUANTITIES PLEASE CALL 800-334-0177.                                                            

DILUTED MATERIAL CANNOT BE RETURNED        

FOR CREDIT.




