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"+x%% | the event of Tie Bids, the winning i

,bid is determined per the Texas Local . AWARDED BIDS -

Calhoun County, Texas BID TABULATION AWARD  sovemmentcote 262.027061. I HIGHLIGHTED IN YELLOW

For Period Beginning JANUARY 1 2020 and Ending DECEMBER 31, 2020

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL RENTOKIL NORTH AMERICA, INC.
BID ITEM UNIT ADAPCO LLC PRODUCTS INC dba TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS UNIVAR SOLUTIONS
MaxPar G2-60
BVA 13 ULV Qil BVA 13 ULV Qil (Paraffinic Base Oil - All quality standards
(Mixture of Highly Refined Mineral Oil (Mixture of Highly Refined Mineral Oil Base meet Group Il requirements, but Viscosity
Mineral Oil Base Stock (oil ) with Additives Mineral Qil Stock (oil ) with Additives Index is below the minimum)
50 Gallon Drum $374.00 $412.50 $365.00 $324.50
55 Gallon Drum $414.70 $453.75 $401.50 No Bid
275 Gallon Tote $2,128.50 $2,200.00 $2,007.50 No Bid
Fyfanon ULV Mosquito Fyfanon ULV AG
(Active Ingredients: Malathion 96.5%; (Active Ingredients: Malathion 96.5%;
MALATHION Other Ingredients 3.5%) Other Ingredients 3.5%)
$3299.45
NO AWARD 55 Gallon Drum $3,464.45 No Bid No Bid But if you use his 55.99 gal amount it is $3,079.45
4 or more 55 Gallon Drums $3299.45
NO AWARD (per drum) $3,464.45 No Bid No Bid But if you use his 55.99 gal amount it is $3,079.45
NO AWARD 260 Gallon Tote $15,446.60 No Bid No Bid $14,710,80
4 or more 260 Gallon Totes
NO AWARD (per tote) $15,446.60 No Bid No Bid $14,710,80
| e B B B ——
Permanone 30-30 Biomist 30+30 ULV Evoluer 30-30 ULV Kontrol 30-30 ULV
(Active Ingredients: Permethrin 30.0%; | (Active Ingredients: Permethrin 30.0%; (Active Ingredients: Permethrin 30.0%; (Active Ingredients: Permethrin 30.0%;
Piperonyl Butoxide 30.0%; Piperonyl butoxide 30.0%; Piperonyl Butoxide 30.0%; Piperonyl Butoxide 30.0%;
30-30 ULV Other Ingredients 40.0%) Other Ingredients 40.0%) Other Ingredients 40.0%) Other Ingredients 40.0%)
$56.52 /5141.30 Case
Bid amount not clear on original bid
2 x 2.5 Gallon Case No Bid $325.00 $301.80 that was submitted
5 Gallon Pail $292.55 No Bid $301.80 No Bid
30 Gallon Drum $1,718.10 $1,950.00 $1,781.40 No Bid
55 Gallon Drum No Bid $3,575.00 $3,249.95 No Bid
275 Gallon Tote $15,589.75 $17,875.00 $16,076.50 No Bid
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Calhoun County, Texas BID TABULATION AWARD AWARDED BIDS -
BID TABULATION AWARD - INSECTICIDES FOR MOSQUITO CONTROL - ALL PRECINCTS HIGHLIGHTED IN YELLOW

For Period Beginning JANUARY 1 2020 and Ending DECEMBER 31, 2020

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL RENTOKIL NORTH AMERICA, INC.
BID ITEM UNIT ADAPCO LLC PRODUCTS INC dba TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS UNIVAR SOLUTIONS
Permanone 31-66 Biomist 31+66 ULV Perm-X UL 31-66
(Active Ingredients: Permethrin 31.28%; |(Active Ingredients: Permethrin 31.28%; (Active Ingredients: Permethrin 31%;
Piperonyl Butoxide 66.0%; Piperonyl Butoxide 66.0%; Other Piperonyl Butoxide 66%;
31-66 ULV Other Ingredients 2.72%) Ingredients 2.72%) Other Ingredients 3%)
4 x 1 Gallon Case $346.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 x 2.5 Gallon Case No Bid $475.00 $463.70 No Bid
30 Gallon Drum $2,600.70 $2,850.00 $2,670.00 No Bid
Permanone 4-8 Ready to Use
(Active Ingredients: Permethrin 3.98%;
Piperonyl Butoxide 8.48%;
4-8 ULV Other Ingredients 87.54%) Bid Evoluer 4-4 ULV not 4-8 ULV
2 x 2.5 Gallon Case $178.40 No Bid Did not bid 4-8 ULV No Bid
5 Gallon Pail No Bid No Bid Did not bid 4-8 ULV No Bid
30 Gallon Tote $1,070.40 No Bid Did not bid 4-8 ULV No Bid
55 Gallon Drum No Bid No Bid Did not bid 4-8 ULV No Bid
275 Gallon Tote $9,812.00 No Bid Did not bid 4-8 ULV No Bid
.|
ALTOSID 30 DAY BRIQUETS Altosid Briquets Altosid Briquets Altosid Briquets
Tie Blds - Award determined by drawing (Active Ingredients: (S)-Methoprene (Active Ingredients: (S)-Methoprene 8.62%; | (Active Ingredients: (S)-Methoprene 8.62%;
in Commissioners' Court 8.62%; Other Ingredients 91.38%) Other Ingredients 91.38%) Other Ingredients 91.38%)
400 Per Case No Bid $476.00 $476.00 $476.00
|
ALTOSID XR EXTENDED RESIDUAL
BRIQUETS - Altosid XR Briquets Altosid Briquets Altosid Briquets Altosid Briquets
Tie Bids-Award determined by drawing in (Active Ingredients: (S)-Methoprene (Active Ingredients: (S)-Methoprene 2.1%; (Active Ingredients: (S)-Methoprene 2.1%;
Commissioners' Court 2.1%; Other Ingredients 97.9%) Other Ingredients 97.9%) Other Ingredients 97.9%)
220 Per Case No Bid $752.40 $752.40 $752.40
— |
Deltagard ULV Imperium
(Active Ingredients: Deltamethrin 2.0%; (Active Ingredients: Deltamethrin 2.0%; Other
DELTAGARD or Equivalent Other Ingredients 98.0%) Ingredients 98.0%)
2 X 2.5 Gallon Case $1,017.65 No Bid $1,006.50 No Bid
30 Gallon Drum $5,908.20 No Bid $5,886.00 No Bid
250 Gallon Drum(Tote) $48,640.00 No Bid $48,437.50 No Bid
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Calhoun County, Texas BID TABULATION AWARD AWARDED BIDS -
BID TABULATION AWARD - INSECTICIDES FOR MOSQUITO CONTROL - ALL PRECINCTS HIGHLIGHTED IN YELLOW
For Period Beginning JANUARY 1 2020 and Ending DECEMBER 31, 2020

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL RENTOKIL NORTH AMERICA, INC.
BID ITEM UNIT ADAPCO LLC PRODUCTS INC dba TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS UNIVAR SOLUTIONS
*Alternate: Vectomax WSP Fourstar Sustained Release 45/90/180
(800 WSP/case) Day Microabial Briquets (Active
(Active Ingredients: Bacillus sphaericus Ingredients: Bacillus sphaericus 2362,
2362, Serotype H5a5b, Strain ABTS 1743 Serotype H5a5b, Strain AML614,
Fermentation Solids, Spores and fermentation solids, spores and
Insecticidal Toxins 2.7%; Bacillus insecticidal toxins 6%; Bacillus

thuringiensis subsp. israelensis Serotype H-|  thuringiensis subspecies israelensis
14, Strain AM65-52 Fermentation Solids, Strain BMP 144, fermentation solids,
FOURSTAR SUSTAINED RELEASE 45 Spores, and Insecticidal Toxins 4.5%; spores and insecticidal toxins 1%; Other
DAY MICROBIAL BRIQUETS Other Ingredients 92.8%) Ingredients 93%)

*ALTERNATE: 800 WSP/Case $1,280.00
45 Day --- 200 Per Case $278.62

No Bid No Bid

FOURSTAR SUSTAINED RELEASE 90

DAY MICROBIAL BRIQUETS 90 Day --- 200 Per Case No Bid $463.24 No Bid No Bid

FOURSTAR SUSTAINED RELEASE 180
DAY MICROBIAL BRIQUETS 180 Day --- 200 Per Case No Bid $723.30

No Bid No Bid
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